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Introduc t ion

Life being what it is, situations of competition and conflict are 
unavoidable among and even within human communities. And the 
rational management of conflicts is impossible in the absence of in-
formation about the capabilities and intentions of one’s opponents. 
Obtaining reports of such matters becomes an indispensable goal. The 
very structure of organizations is defined by arrangements for who re-
ports to whom.

The mythological patron of reporting is Mercury, the messenger of 
the gods, and the value of reporting has been acknowledged through-
out history. Short of conversation, there is no form of human commu-
nication more extensive and prominent than reportage. Reports of 
one sort or another use our prime instruments for informed thinking, 
seeing that virtually the whole of what we know about what goes on in 
the world comes to us through reports. The topic of reporting has vari-
ous philosophical dimensions: logical, epistemic, ethical, practical, and 
others. However, the present deliberations will focus on the epistemic 
dimension and will seek to integrate the rational theory of reporting 
into the wider setting of knowledge-related issues. The complexity of 
the overall problem-area is immense, and it is judicious to transit its 
components one at a time.

There are innumerably different type of reports: articles in newspa-
pers, encyclopedias, reference books, accounts of travel writers, police 
reports, and on and on. In the present discussion, however, illustrations 
will be mainly developed with a view to the reports of diplomats and 
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espionage agents. For the features of reports in general stand out with 
particular vividness here. Accordingly, the present book is emphatical-
ly not an essay on journalism but focuses predominantly on issues of 
diplomatic and military intelligence. It is predicated in the idea that the 
tradecraft of reporting in the context of intelligence operations opens 
an inductive window upon the epistemology of reportage.

While philosophers since Descartes have hankered for absolute 
certainty, this is simply unrealistic. What actually passes for knowl-
edge among us in everyday life is information that enjoys reasonable 
assurance even if not categorical certainty. And most of this comes to 
us through reports of various kinds. Accordingly, the epistemology of 
reporting is—and should be—of paramount concern for us. To be sure, 
the philosophical skeptic, inclined to think that we really cannot know 
anything with adequate assurance, would propose to see all reports as 
functioning on the level playing field of undifferentiated unacceptabil-
ity. As skeptics have generally themselves admitted, such a position can 
of course find no traction in the practical realm of human affairs and 
action—for obvious reasons. Most of what we take ourselves to know 
is not something certifiable with the Cartesian certainty of “clear and 
distinct knowledge” but rather something possessed of suboptimal 
credibility and reliability. Our knowledge, like our domestic domicile, 
is built for use in standard and normal conditions: it is not an impreg-
nable fortress. And reporting constitutes a prime sector of knowledge 
management.

Reports crowd upon us at every turn—via the media, in work sit-
uations, and even in casual conversation. Only some of the time do 
they really matter in their bearing on what we should be doing in the 
management of our affairs. But it is bound to happen, sufficiently often, 
that a clear understanding of the issues involved with reportage serves a 
constructive function, especially in the crucial area of “matters of state.” 
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It is not the aim of this book to engage with the technical issues of 
intelligence management—nor, for that matter, with the vast technical 
issues of information science, communication theory, testimony, and 
related formal disciplines. Rather its concern is with the most basic 
and fundamental issues of reporting practice—with special emphasis 
on matters of stats relating to statecraft and international and military 
affairs. Accordingly, the range of examples focus upon natural security 
reportage of the sort provided to a government by its diplomatic and 
intelligence reporting agents with a view to the management of mat-
ters of state. This is done not because it is typical of reporting—there 
is perhaps no such thing as “typical reportage”—but rather because the 
sorts of issues that arise with reporting in support of statecraft here 
occur with particular prominence. And so the reports that will primar-
ily concern us here are those that address issues of intended conflict 
in warfare and diplomacy—the reports of diplomatic and espionage 
agents. After all, intelligence information in matters of statecraft and 
of warfare, that “continuation of politics by other means,” afford the 
most vivid examples of need for and use of reports. Accordingly, the 
illustrative example to be given here will be drawn from this domain—
primarily in the context of the vast mega-conflict of the Second World 
War.

The introduction of precision and clarity into deliberations about 
reporting is a much needed desideratum, and the present book will 
undertake some steps in this direction. The absence of a general intro-
duction to the theory of reporting is regrettable, and it is the author’s 
hope that his book will make a small contribution toward filling a re-
grettably regrettable gap.

The overall plan of the book stands as follows: It begins with an ini-
tial stage setting of the reporting process that locates it within the over-
all project of information management, to which we stand committed 
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in the natural order of things. It then proceeds chapter by chapter to 
examine the principle components of reporting: the basic sources, the 
contribution of intent, the transmission of the message, and then mat-
ters of interpretation, evaluating, and utilization. The aim is to provide, 
step by step, a critical survey of the prospects and problems that char-
acterize information reportage in intelligence matters.

A clear lesson to emerge from these deliberations is the convoluted 
complexity of intelligence report management. So many different and 
often conflicting considerations are in play here that the surprise is not 
that the business can be managed well but that it can be managed at all.

Finally, a brief terminological clarification. As here used, the verb 
“to report” indicates the act, and “a report” is the result of its exercise; 
“reporting” is the activity at issue with the act, and “reportage” will be 
used both for the collective product of the activity when engaged in 
repeatedly and also for the reporting practice at large.
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